
Events
ACT
No group events listed for March or 
April. Check the events listing online at 
h ttp ://ww w. a I i a. o rg. a u/eve n ts/n sw. h t m

NSW
12 March 2009: ALIA Hunter 
professional development activity: 
what neXus 2 revealed. Join Gillian 
Hallam and Dianne Walton-Sonda for 
dinner, drinks, and lively discussion. 
Hear Gillian discuss the neXus2 survey 
findings and be inspired. Thursday 12th 
Mar 2009, 6pm Aloi Thai Restaurant,
50 Beaumont St, Hamilton RSVP: Mon 
8th Mar 2009. For more information, 
contact Julia Gollan, Julia.gollan@ 
hnehealth.nsw.gov.au.

17 April 2009: Tour of the CSIRO Energy 
Transformed Flagship site. The CSIRO 
site at Mayfield West was built as a 
showcase of energy efficiency. Followed 
by the ALIA Hunter monthly meeting in 
the library. Friday 17 April 2pm CSIRO
I 0 Murray Dwyer Circuit Steel River 
Industrial Park Mayfield West NSW 
For more information, contact Lynette 
Frazer, ph 02 4980 2282, lynette. 
frazer@avondale.edu.au.

NT
I I  March 2009: March Red Centre 
meeting. Charles Darwin University 
Library 6.30pm Margaret Ellis and 
Tammy Schluter (both studying 
librarianship and working in libraries 
in Alice Springs) will report on their 
experiences studying via distance 
education. For more information, 
contact Fiona Blackburn, ph 08 8950 
0557, fblackburn@astc.nt.gov.au.

18 March 2009: Library Tour, Casuarina 
Library. 5:00pm for a 5:30 start. For 
more information, contact Warren 
Winship, ph 08 8922 0752, w.winship® 
darwin.nt.gov.au

8 April 2009: April Red Centre meeting: 
Time to be confirmed -  will be during 
the day. Visit to NT Archives (during 
Heritage Week 4 - 1 9  Aprii). For more 
information, contact Fiona Blackburn, 
ph 08 8950 0557, fblackburn@astc. 
nt.gov.au.

15 April 2009: Committee Meeting 5pm 
for 5:30pm start -  Casuarina Library.
For more information, contact Warren 
Winship, ph 08 8922 0752, w.winship@ 
darwin.nt.gov.au.

QLD
31 March 2009: QOPAFs March Event 
Helen Gambley - Hopgood Ganim 
Lawyers. Time: 12 noon. Venue: Level 8, 
Waterfront P lace l, Eagle Street,

h t t p : / / w w w . a l i a . o r g . a u / e v e n t s
Brisbane. For more information, contact 
Helen Gambley, ph 07 3024 0391, 
h.gambley@hopgoodganim.com.au

SA
No group events listed for March or 
April. Check the events listing online at 
http://www.alia.org.au/events/sa.htm

TAS
25 March 2009: ALIATas Committee 
Meeting: All Tas ALIA members 
welcome. We meet on the last 
Wednesday of every month, Feb-Nov. 
Time usually 5.00pm. Please contact Ian 
morrison to confirm time and venue. For 
more information, contact Ian Morrison, 
ph 03 6233 7474, ian.morrison@ 
education.tas.gov.au.

29 April 2009: ALIA Tas Committee 
Meeting All Tas ALIA members 
welcome. We meet on the last 
Wednesday of every month, Feb-Nov. 
Time usually 5.00pm. Please contact Ian 
Morrison to confirm time and venue. For 
more information, contact Ian Morrison 
, ph 03 6233 7474, ian.morrison@ 
education.tas.gov.au.

VIC
20 March 2009: Skool trek: Designed 
for those working in school libraries, this 
great networking opportunity will visit 
3 innovative school libraries. Lunch and 
coach transportation provided (costs to 
follow). To join the mailing list or for 
more information, contact Kerrie Kelly, 
ph 03 8664 7155, kkelly@slv.vic.gov.au

W A
No group events listed for March or 
April. Check the events listing online at 
http://www.alia.org.au/events/wa.htm.

National events and 
campaigns
26 March 2009: ALIA Public Libraries 
Summit, The theme of the Summit is 
'Setting a national agenda'. The Summit 
will be held at the National Library of 
Australia. Attendance is by invitation 
only though anyone is welcome to make 
a submission. For more information, 
contact Marion Nicolson, marion. 
nicolson@alia.org.au or visit the website 
www.alia.org.au/summit09

2 April 2009: International Children's 
Book Day

Conferences
15-18 September 2009: ALIA National 
Library and Information Technicians 
Conference 2009, Technology Technique 
Unique, Adelaide. http://conferences. 
alia.org.au/libtec2009/

PD opportunities
For a listing of this month's PD 
opportunities, visit the online event 
listing: http://www.alia.org.au/events/

Non-ALIA conferences
15-16 April 2009 : ATSILIRN
conference for 2009: Rising to the 
Challenges: Information Services for 
Indigenous Australians will showcase 
programs from within the information 
profession that aims to inform and 
educate Indigenous people. Venue: 
University of Notre Dame Australia, 
Broome Campus. For more information, 
contact Melissa Jackson, ph 02 9273 
1577, mjackson@sl.nsw.gov.au.

23-27 August 2009: IFLA World Library 
and Information Congress.Libraries 
create futures: Building on cultural 
heritage, Milan, Italy.http://www.ifla.org/ 
IV/ifla75/index.htm 

31 August-4 September 2009: ICML 
2009 - The 10th International Congress 
on Medical Librarianship, Positioning 
the profession, Brisbane. http://www. 
icml2009.com/

For a listing of other non-ALIA 
conferences, visit http://www.alia.org. 
au/conferences/other.html
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