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FEDERAL COURT DECISIONS
Sole parent 
pension: AAT 
applied wrong 
legislation
CADMAN v SECRETARY TO DSS 
(Federal C ourt of A ustralia)
Decided: 3 December 1993 by Neaves J. 
M argaret Cadman was paid Class A 
widow’s pension and sole parent pen­
sion from March 1980 to April 1989, 
when the DSS cancelled her pension 
and decided that C adm an had been 
overpaid $42,604.40 because she had 
not been a single person throughout the 
period when she received her pension 
payments.

The AAT affirm ed the DSS deci­
sion. Cadman appealed to the Federal 
Court under s. 44(1) of the AAT Act.

Applying the w rong legislation
In its Reasons for Decision, the AAT 
had apparen tly  ap p lied  ss. 3A and 
43A(6) of the Social Security Act 1947, 
provisions which took effect from 1 
January 1990.

The AAT had said that the question 
to be decided was w hether Cadman 
was living in a marriage-like relation­
ship during the 9 years in question. The 
AAT had said that, in deciding that 
question, it would pay particular regard 
to the factors listed in s.3A. The AAT 
had then examined the evidence and 
concluded ‘that the weight o f evidence 
before us does not support the forma­
tion of an opinion that [the applicant] 
was not living in a marriage-like rela­
tio n sh ip  w ith  [M r P] (ss .3 A  and 
43A(6)).’

Neaves J said that the AAT had mis­
takenly expressed the question before it 
as w hether Cadm an w as living in a 
m arriage-like relationsh ip . But that 
concept was introduced only from 1 
January 1990, after the end of the rele­
vant period. The question, as posed by 
the legislation in force before 1 January 
1990, shou ld  have been  w hether 
Cadman was living with a man as his 
wife on a bona fide domestic basis.

Neaves J said that neither that error 
nor the AAT’s references to the factors 
in s.3A was the type of error of law 
which would justify the Federal Court’s 
intervention. The s.3A  factors were 
undoubtedly relevant to the issue which

the AAT had to decide, Neaves J said; 
and the AAT’s reference to those fac­
tors rather than to the principles laid 
down by the Federal Court in Lambe 
(1981) 4 SSR 43 was of no significance.

H ow ever, the A A T ’s reliance on 
s.43A(6) in reaching its decision had 
involved an error of law, Neaves J said. 
In e ffe c t, the  use o f  s.43A (6) had 
imposed a ‘reverse onus’ o f proof on 
Cadman: because the AAT could not 
decide conclusively that she was not 
living in a marriage-like relationship, 
the AAT had decided that she was liv­
ing in such a re la tionsh ip  and was 
therefore ineligible for pension pay­
ments. As s.43A(6) was not in force 
during the period of disputed eligibility 
for pension, this was an error of law 
w hich ju stified  allow ing C adm an’s 
appeal.

Refusal to waive overpayment
A fte r decid ing  th a t C adm an had 
received an overpayment of pension, 
the AAT had refused to waive recovery 
of the overpaym ent because the cir­
cum stances o f the case did not fall 
within the Minister’s Determination of 
8 July 1991 which, the AAT had said, 
restricted the waiver power conferred 
by s. 1237(1) of the 1991 Act.

Neaves J noted that the Federal Court 
had decided, in Riddell (1993) 73 SSR 
1067, that the Minister’s Determination 
was invalid. Accordingly, the AAT’s 
reliance on that Determination in refus­
ing to waive recovery from Cadman 
provided a second ground for allowing 
Cadman’s appeal.

Form al decision
The Federal Court allowed the appeal, 
set aside the AAT’s decision and remit­
ted the matter to the AAT for determi­
nation according to law.

[P.H.]

Overpayments: 
conspiracy to 
defraud the DSS
KALW Y v SECRETARY TO  DSS
(No. 2)
(Federal C ourt of Australia)
Decided: 22 December 1993 by 
Beazley J.

Kalwy was an employee of the DSS. A 
num ber o f people, including Kalwy, 
allegedly conspired to defraud the DSS 
by arranging for paym ents of unem­
ploym ent benefits to bank accounts 
under fictitious names. Those people 
were charged w ith various crim inal 
offences; Kalwy was discharged at the 
end of the committal proceedings; and 
others were convicted.

The DSS then decided that Kalwy 
was indebted to the Commonwealth 
under s.246(l) of the Social Security 
Act 1947, because moneys had been 
paid out in consequence of false state­
ments. The AAT affirmed that deci­
sion: Kalwy (1992) 67 SSR 950. On 
appeal, the Federal Court set aside the 
AAT’s decision: Kalwy (1992) 70 SSR 
996. T he F ed era l C ourt held  tha t 
s.246(l) could only operate to create a 
debt in a person who had received the 
moneys in question; noted that this had 
not been established in the present case; 
and remitted the matter to the AAT for 
re-determination.

The AAT then decided that Kalwy 
had been a party to the conspiracy; that, 
in consequence o f that conspiracy, 
Kalwy had received at least one half of 
the am ounts paid  to four fic titious 
names, namely $27,099.99; and that the 
Secretary could recover that amount 
from Kalwy under s.246(l) o f the 1947 
Act: Kalwy (No. 2) (1993) 74 SSR 
1078.

Kalwy then appealed to the Federal 
Court, claiming that the AAT had made 
several errors of law.

No evidence to support finding?
Beazley J rejected the argument raised 
on behalf of Kalwy that there had been 
no evidence before the AAT capable of 
su p porting  the A A T ’s decision . 
B eazley  J no ted  th a t the ev idence 
included a conversation between other 
participants in the conspiracy, identify­
ing Kalwy as a recipient of part of the 
moneys paid out by the DSS, and a 
rap id  in c rease  in K alw y ’s bank  
accounts at about the time of the con­
spiracy.

Beazley J re-stated the limits of an 
appeal under s.44 of the AAT Act:
• A wrong finding o f fact does not

co n stitu te  an e rro r o f law  -
Waterford v Commonwealth (1987)
163 CLR 54 at 77.

• W ant o f log ic  in the draw ing of
inferences is not an error of law -  R
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