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nights per week primarily for his own 
convenience, as the house was close to 
his place of employment, where he also 
drank after work. Ridley incorrectly 
stated to the DSS that she was paying 
lodg ing  o f $40  p er w eek to R. W. 
Ridley of the same address.

In Ju ly  1981 R id ley  and R obert 
Ridley entered into a contract to pur­
chase jointly a property at Wanneroo. 
Ridley’s parents were willing to con­
tribute the deposit, but she could not 
service a loan. Robert Ridley had no 
savings, bu t was elig ib le for a  loan 
from  D efence  S erv ice  H om es 
Corporation. As a condition of provid­
ing the d ep o s it, R id le y ’s p aren ts  
required that her name be on the title. 
In order to obtain the loan in their joint 
names, they made a statement on the 
loan application that they had been in a 
de facto marriage relationship for three 
years and resided in the same house.

It was agreed, that Ridley and her 
children would live in the home, and 
that Robert Ridley would continue the 
previous arrangement of sleeping there 
one or two nights per week as it suited 
him. Ridley made all the mortgage pay­
ments and she and Mr Ridley shared 
equally the water and land rates. Ridley 
continued to claim rent allowance from 
the DSS although she was no longer 
paying ren t

R id ley  b ecam e p reg an t to M r 
Ridley. She gave birth to a son Gavin 
in April 1982. M r Ridley was not at all 
interested in the baby. Sexual relations 
ceased during the pregnancy but Mr 
Ridley continued to stay as before, for 
his own convenience.

After Mr R idley’s m other died in 
January 1983, he agreed with his father 
that a self-contained dwelling be erect­
ed at the rear o f the Wanneroo property 
for the jo in t occupation  o f  the two 
Ridley men. Mr Ridley senior provided 
the funds for the construction.

F o llo w in g  the v is it  o f  a F ie ld  
Officer, Ridley’s benefit was suspend­
ed on 7 August 1987. On 5 July 1988 
the DSS advised Ridley that an over­
payment had been raised in an amount 
later fixed at $46 339. Ridley appealed 
to the SSA T, denying  th a t she and 
Ridley had been living on a basis simi­
lar to that o f a  m arried couple. She 
withdrew her appeal in view of a pend­
ing prosecution.

Following suspension of her benefit, 
Ridley decided to sell the property and 
re tu rn  to  liv e  w ith  h er p a ren ts  in 
C ow ra. T o p rev en t the sa le  o f  his 
hom e, M r R id ley  agreed  th a t they

would live as a married couple and that 
he would support her. They took up 
residence together in the main house in 
October 1987, and married in January
1988.

In July 1989, after a trial, Ridley 
was convicted of offences under the 
Act and on 14 August 1989 she was 
sentenced to 18 months imprisonment 
and ordered to pay reparation to the 
Commonwealth in the sum of $40 405. 
The Director of Public Prosecutions did 
not pursue recovery of the moneys due 
under the reparation order. Following 
her release from prison, Ridley recom­
m enced her appeal to the SSA T, 
expressly  denying that she and Mr 
Ridley had been living in a de facto 
relationship.

Evaluation of evidence 
The AAT accepted the truth of the evi­
dence given by Ridley, which was cor­
roborated on some aspects by her 19 
year old son and her mother. She was 
able to account for the evidence against 
her in a way which was reasonably 
credible and consistent.

The DSS case relied on circumstan­
tial evidence. Ridley had at all times 
when interview ed by a DSS officer 
denied that she was living with Ridley 
in a de facto relationship. There was no 
evidence of shared finances, shared 
fam ily  life  or tha t M r R idley  ever 
p laced  his possessions in R id ley ’s 
house. Although Ridley had made false 
representations to the Department con­
cerning her living arrangements, the 
purpose was not necessarily to hide the 
existence of a de facto relationship. She 
may have wished merely to avoid the 
risk that the DSS might wrongly form 
that conclusion.

The AAT could not be reasonably 
satisfied that Ridley ever lived with Mr 
Ridley as his de facto wife during the 
relevant period.

Jurisdiction
The AAT rejected a submission by the 
DSS th a t it lack ed  ju risd ic tio n  to 
review the matter, or that it should not 
do so, in view of the previous decision 
of a criminal court to convict the appli­
cant. In finding that it had jurisdiction, 
the AAT followed previous decisions 
in Re Secretary, D SS an d  P om ersbach
(1992) 65 SSR 912; R e Secretary, D SS  
and M ario t (1992) 66 SSR 937; and Re  
W V C  a n d  S e c re ta ry , D S S  (1992) 67 
SSR 951. The reparation order was not 
affected by the AAT’s decision. The 
AAT’s decision replaced the original 
executive decision of the Secretary.

AAT Decisions H

Form al decision
The AAT set aside both the decisions 
of the delegate and the SSAT affirming 
the d e leg a te ’s decision , found that 
Ridley was during the period from 16 
July 1981 to 6 August 1987 not living 
with a man as his de facto wife and 
re fe rred  the  m a tte r back  to the 
Secretary to calculate Ridley’s entitle­
ments.

[PO’C]

Overpayment: 
married person
A RM U O  and SECRETARY TO 
DSS

(No. 8120)

Decided: 24 July 1992 by M.D. Allen 
and J. Kalowski.

The supporting parent’s benefit being 
paid to Lusvenia Armijo was cancelled 
on 24 September 1986 on the basis that 
she was married. On 17 July 1987, the 
DSS ra ised  an o v erp ay m en t o f 
$24 657.10 for the period 23 September 
1982 to 24 July 1986, which Armijo 
was requested to repay.

A rm ijo  requested  rev iew  o f that 
decision, which was affirm ed by an 
A u th o rised  R ev iew  O ffice r  on 16 
March 1988.

On review, the SSAT affirmed that 
decision and a further decision of DSS 
on 3 April 1992 not to waive the over­
payment.

Armijo then requested review by the 
AAT of both decisions.

The facts
Armijo arrived in Australia in 1974, 
pregnant with her son Jason. Shortly 
afterwards she and two other women 
moved into a house which was occu­
pied by her second cousin, M, and his 
bro ther. A fter the b irth  o f  her son, 
Armijo was paid supporting parent’s 
benefit. She returned to work in 1981 
and the benefit was cancelled. After 
losing her job in 1982, Armijo was paid 
the supporting parent’s benefit again.

In the meantime Armijo, M and 3 
other persons had bought a house in 
R andw ick as tenants in com m on in 
equal shares. In 1981 Armijo and M 
bought a property  in Paddington as 
jo in t  ten an ts . T he p u rch ase  was 
financed by a mortgage. Armijo and M
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were married on 23 November 1981. 
When the DSS became aware o f this in 
1987, Armijo’s benefit was cancelled.

The law
T he A A T  ap p lied  the  d ec is io n  o f  
C irk o v sk i  (1992) 67 SSR  955 when 
deciding which Act should be applied. 
The 1947 Act applied to the decision to 
raise the overpayment and the 1991 Act 
to the decision to recover the overpay­
ment.

Relying on the Federal Court deci­
sion of H ales  (1983) 47 ALR 281, the 
AAT agreed with the DSS that it was 
reviewing two separate decisions.

Section 3(1) o f the 1947 Act defined 
a married person as not including a per­
son w ho was liv ing  separately  and 
apart from the person’s spouse, or who 
for any special reason should not be 
treated as a  married person.

The evidence
Armijo told the AAT that the marriage 
was a sham to help M gain custody of 
h is d au g h te rs  liv in g  in Peru . T his 
w ould enable him  to bring them  to 
Australia. Both Armijo and M told the 
AAT that the marriage had never been 
consummated. The only time they held 
themselves out to be married was to the 
immigration authorities.

However the evidence showed that 
in fact M  had stated on several occa­
sions that he was married when it was 
to his advantage. M had applied for a 
Bankcard and a M astercard and had 
stated that he was married to Armijo on 
both forms.

M ’s explanation to the AAT that he 
did not understand the forms was not 
accepted as he had a good command of 
English and held a  number of influen­
tial positions in the community.

In her application for supporting 
parent’s benefit, Armijo had stated that 
she was single and paying rent to Mr 
and Mrs M at the same address where 
she was living. At that time Armijo was 
m arried  and liv in g  w ith  M a t the 
Randwick address.

The AAT’s assessment
After the AAT heard all the evidence it
found that there were:

‘numerous other examples which can be 
taken from the evidence of Juan 
Montesinos to demonstrate that his evi­
dence was unsatisfactory and contradic­
tory. Neither did his demeanour inspire 
confidence in his veracity . . . [t]he 
Applicant herself had a pathological 
inability to give direct and frank evi­
dence.’

(Reasons, paras 38 and 39).

The AAT concluded that the rela­
tionship between Armijo and M was 
unclear. There was evidence of deliber­
ate attempts to mislead several govern­
ment departments. Armijo submitted 
that as she did not have an interpreter at 
the interview with DSS, much of the 
ev idence  b ased  on th a t in te rv iew  
should be rejected. The AAT rejected 
that submission, finding evidence that 
Armijo understood far more English 
than she admitted.

Armijo and M held property jointly, 
had jo in t bank accounts and Armijo 
had credit cards in M ’s name.

The AAT decided that Armijo and 
M were not living separately and apart 
and there was no special reason not to 
treat Armijo as a married person. The 
AAT did not think it appropriate ‘to 
seek to explain away inconsistencies in 
evidence by simply referring to cultural 
differences’.

W aiver
The Ministerial directions published on 
13 May 1992 were applied by the AAT 
when considering the waiver provisions 
under s.1237 of the 1991 Act. It was 
accepted  that A rm ijo was living in 
straitened financial circumstances and 
was unlikely to ever repay the total 
overpayment. The AAT concluded that 
it could waive the overpayment only if 
special circumstances existed.

In deciding on the rate of recovery 
the SSAT had been influenced adverse­
ly by the fact that Armijo was repre­
sented by a barrister and that her son 
attended a private school. The AAT 
re jec ted  th ese  co n sid e ra tio n s  and 
reduced the rate of recovery, largely to 
avoid an adverse effect on A rm ijo’s 
son, who was in his final year of sec­
ondary study at a private school.

Form al decision
The AAT affirmed the decision to raise 
the overpayment but set aside the deci­
sion to recover the amount at the rate of 
$59.71 per week, reducing the rate to 
$50 per week.

[C.H.]

Wife’s pension: 
m ale to female 
transexual
SECRETARY TO  DSS and SRA 

(No. 8219)

Decided: 4 September 1992 by D.F. 
O ’C onnor, B .A . B arbour and D .J. 
Grimes.
SRA w as a p re -o p era tiv e  (m ale to 
fem ale) transexual. The SSA T had 
decided that SRA was entitled to a wife 
pension on the basis that SRA was liv­
ing in a d e  f a c to  relationship with a 
m ale pensioner, B. The Departm ent 
appealed against this decision to the 
AAT.

SRA was bom a male child in 1965. 
She had felt different from an early age 
and when she was 16 she realised she 
was a transexual and sought psycholog­
ical counselling. She also saw psychia­
trists and an endocrino logist, com ­
mencing horm one therapy in March
1983. From April 1983 she started to 
present as a woman, and had done so 
ever since.

SRA had been living with B since 
April 1984. SRA had been in receipt of 
unemployment benefit since February
1984, in a fem ale  nam e. She was 
advised in January 1985 that w ife’s 
pension (as it was called  under the 
1947 Act) was the appropriate payment 
by a field officer. She did not tell the 
o ff ic e r  th a t she w as a  tran sex u a l 
because she knew she was a woman 
and had been living hs one for 2 years. 
W ife’s pension was granted from 10 
January 1985.

B and SRA separated in February 
1987 for a short time and B told the 
DSS; SRA’s w ife’s pension was can­
celled. SRA com m enced to receive 
unemployment benefit. In March 1987 
the DSS obtained  a copy o f SR A ’s 
birth certificate and received anony­
mous advice that B was living with 
another man, SRA.

In N ovem ber 1987 SRA told the 
DSS that she and B were living togeth­
er again, but that she wanted to stay on 
unemployment benefit. However, she 
was transferred to wife’s pension from 
26 November 1987. In October 1990, 
the DSS informed SRA that she did not 
qualify for wife’s pension.

In 1989, SRA again saw her psychi­
atrist who said she was ready for sex 
reassignment surgery. However, SRA 
did not pursue this because of the cost, 
some $5000. A series of doctors lodged
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